COMPETITIVE SOLICIT N TAEULATION
W)

o FAILURE TO FILE A PROTEST WITHIN THE TIME PRESCRIBED IN SECTION 120.53(5), FLORIDA STATUTES, SHALL
CONSTITUTE A WAIVER OF PROCEEDINGS UNDER CHAPTER 120, FLORIDA STATUTES, ALL BIDS/PROPOSALS
BUDGET NUMBER
— Z? _j, . A ACCEPTED BY THE STATE ARE SUBJECT TO THE STATES TERMS AND CONDITIONS AND ANY AND ALL ADDITIONAL
SOLICITATION NUMB? j L 9 _9 TERMS AND CONDITIONS SUBMITTED BY THE BIDDER/PROPSERS ARE REJECTED AND SHALL HAVE NO FORCE AND
. =~ A EFFECT. OFFERS FROM THE VENDORS LISTED HEREIN ARE THE ONLY OFFERS RECEIVED TIMELY AS OF THE ABOVE
soLtcrration TrrLedC yui L[ € ”?’ ifenput tz‘?f“‘ﬂ’”! Gime ‘OPENING DATE AND TIME. ALL OTHER OFFERS SUBMITTED IN RESPONSE TO THE SOLICITATION, IF ANY, ARE
OPENING DATE < Yofo ¥ TIME 3 Phrs HEREBY REJECTED AS LATE.
ve ,
POSTING TIME/DATE i NOTICE OF COMPETITIVE SOLICITATION PROTEST BONDING REQUIREMENT - Any person who files an action
f l°2 W , *2 . f protesting a decision or intended decision pertaining to contracts administered by the Division or a State Ageney pursuant to section
FROM: L5 AU / % 120.57(3)(b), Florida Statutes, shall post with the Division or State Agency, a bond payable to the Division or State Agency i an amount
UNTIL: ” . g / W / /2’ equal to 19% of the estimated value of the protestor's competitive solicitation response; 10% of the estimated expenditure during the
* = —_— —2 — contract term; $10,000; or whichever is less. The bond shall be conditioned upon the payment of all costs which may be adjudged against
PAGE: . OF / - PAGES the contractor filing the protest acticn, in the administrative hearing in which the action is brought and in any subsequent appellate court
- proceeding. For protest of decisiens or intended decisions of the Division pertaining to agencies requests for approval of exceptional
M #. / p( ’e 7(‘) [ 0/ z,?_/;; ) purchases, the bond shall be in the amount equal to 10% of the requesting agencies estimate of the contract amount for the exceptional
/' —5- 67 purchase requested or 310,000, whichever is less, in lieu of 2 bond, the Division or State Agency may, in either case, accept a cashier’s
2 ﬂ{ &‘I’/ 2/7 £ e check or money order in the amount of the bond. Failure of the protesting contractor to file the required bond, cashier's check or money
% ; ﬂ ‘df ﬂ/j / f / 3, 7 r order at the time of filing the formal protest shall result in the denial of the protest.
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TABULATED BY: AWARDED BY: /\/ VERIFIED BY:
w

REMARKS: CIRCLED PRICE INDICATES INTENT TO AWARD, NOT AS SPECIFIED CODE({S)




Soils Lab yellow is lowest bid
Equipment Vendor (Item#) VWR ELE International Hart/Latimer Humboldt Fisher Pacific Quantity
Ro-Tap Sieve Shaker ELE International (#E180-0420/02) $1,898.32 $1,714.45 $2,217.00 $1,889.00 $1.593.94 $2,132.00 1 :
1 |ltem 1'goesto Fisher
8-12" Large Sieve Shaker Geotest, Inc. (#S1-2504) $781.00 $3,163.38 $888.50 2
NO BID NO BID NO BID 1 |ltems 2-3 go to Humboldt
Vacuum Pump ELE International (# EI88- $957.10 $1,176.00 $696.00 $1,312.32 $1,277.00 3
21000 NO BID 1 |jltems 2-3 go to Humboldt
(Automatic Mechanical Compactor Set ELE International (#E12310/02) $6,377.55 $7,192.00 $6,950.00 4
NO BID NO BID NO BID 1 |ltems 4-5go to ELE
Soil Mixer ELE International (#E188-3000/02) $3,915.95 $4,807.00 $4,719.00 $5,638.00 5
NO BID NO BID 1 ltems 4-5 go to ELE
|Automatic Consolidometer (Compucon) Geotest, Inc. (#52848) $7,614.00 $595.00 6 .
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 1 ltem 6 goes to Humboldt low bid not same
Table Top Consolidometer Set ELE International (#E12220) $2,140.30 $2,668.00 $1,963.00 $4,324.00 7
NO BID NO BID 1 ltems 7-9 go'to Humboldt
Triaxial Testing Device Set ELE International (#E12021/02) $22,313.35 $27,851.00 $15.345.00 $29,413.00 8
NO BID NO BID 1 |ltems 7-9 go to Humboldt
Unconfined Compression Machine ELE International (#E125-3605) $2,437.80 $1,927.00 $1,995.00 9
NO BID NO BID NO BID 1 ltems 7-9 go'to Humboldt
Multi-Loader (Versa Loader) ELE International (#E125-3525) $2.635.00 $3,350.00 $3,572.00 $5,645.00 10
NO BID NO BID 1 ltems 10-11 go to ELE
Lab Oven Humboldt, Inc. (#H-30128) $1,949.50 $569.50 $649.00 $1,000.60 $754.60 11
NO BID 1 ltems 10-11 go to ELE
Hot Plate Humboldt, Inc. (H-4950) $214.89 $227.80 $237.00 $280.00 12 :
NO BID 1 ltem 12 goes to Fischer
Muffle Furnace ELE International (#E188-0110/02) $1,362.05 $1,056.55 $1,293.00 $1,119.00 $1,172.60 $1,230.20 13
1 ltems 13-14 go t0 ELE
Mixer (Disperser) ELE International (E124-4132/02) $293 25 $372.00 $318.00 $340.50 14
NO BID NO BID 1 ltems 13-14 go to ELE
Small Digital Scale Gilson, Inc. (CP-306H) $1,029.83 $323.00 $354.88 $330.00 15
NO BID NO BID 1 ltems 15 goes to Humboldt
Motorized Liquid Limit Tester ELE International (E124-0441/02) $650.25 $802.00 $712.00 $719.60 16
NO BID NO BID 1 |fitems 16-17 go to ELE
Sample Ejector ELE International (# E123-4085) $538.05 $670.00 $589.00 $635.50 17
NO BID NO BID 1 ltems 16-17 go to ELE
Non Vacuum Desiccator Cabinet ELE International (EI188-6700) $383.77 $478.55 $600.00 $912.00 $523.40 $911.00 18
1 |fitems 18 goes to VWR
Basic Hand Operated Compaction Set ELE International (# E2300) $1,285.20 $1,562.00 $1,080.00 $1,233.00 19
NO BID NO BID 1 fitems 19-20 go to Humboldt
Combination Permeameter ELE International ( # 25-0623; $501.50 $627.00 $432.00 $446.70 20
¢ ) NO BID _ NO BID 1 |ltems 20-24 go to ELE
Proving Ring Penetrometer ELE International ( # 29-3739) $657.05 $810.00 $741.00 $778.50 21
NO BID NO BID 1 ltems 20-24 go to ELE
Portable Dynamic Cone Penetrometer/Auger Set ELE International ( # 29-5500 $617.10 $763.00 $611.00 $698.40 22
Y 9 ¢ ) NO BID _ NO BID 1 |ltems 20-24 go to ELE
ELE Hand Auger Set ELE International ( # 29-5500) $152.15 $217.00 $1,266.20 23
NO BID NO BID NO BID 1 ltems 20-24 go to ELE
Volumeasure ELE International ( # 29-4522; $391.00 $487.00 $442.00 $468.00
( ) NO BID _ NO BID 24 1 |ltems 20-24 go to ELE
Sample Ejector ELE International (# E123-4085) $538.05 $670.00 $589.00 $577.00
Pt ( ) NO BID _ NO BID 25 1 |pulled from bid not needed
Double Ring Infiltrometer ELE International (Item # 25- NO BID $1,929.50 $2,420.00 $2,156.00 NO BID $2,344.00 26 1 |fitem 26 goes to ELE
Enwvironmental/Hydraulics Lab
[Description Vendor Hart/l atimer Humboldi Fisher Pacific
Forced Air Lab Oven Humboldt, Inc. (H-30356) NO BID $1,936.00 $1:36243 $2.183.50 27 Item 27 goes to VWR
1,949, £ 49. 1,000. 754
Lab Oven Humboldt, Inc. (H-30128) $1,949.50 e NO BID $649.00 $1.000.60 $754.60 28 Item28 goes to ELE
201.60 227.80 237.00 166.26 272.00
Hot Plates Humboldt, Inc. (H-4950) § § NO BID § § 29 Item 29 goes toFisher
- . $1,029.66 323.00 354.89/709.78 $330.00
Small Digital Scale Gilson, Inc. (CP-306H) NO BID NO BID 30 ltem 30 goes to Humboldt




(WARD’S Groundwater Simulation System \Ward, Inc. (80 VV5760) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 31 1
. 957.10 1,176.00 69600 $1,312.32 $1,277.00
Vacuum Pump ELE International (EI88-3100/02) NO BID $ s 32 1 |item 32 goes to Humboldt
Large Digital Scale Gilson, Inc. (AD-40KA) NO BID NO BID $3,225.00 $573.25 $2,850.00 33 1  jitem 33 goes to VWR; low bid not the same item
Structures/Construction Lab
- VWR ELE International Hart/Latimer Humboldt Fisher Pacific Quanti]
Description \Vendor M
. " $376.00 nb $428.50
Asphalt/Concrete Mixer Gilson, Inc. (MA-66) NO BID NO BID NO BID 34 1 |jltem 34 goes to Humboldt
. . 3,170.00 1,177.84 2,195.55
Masonry Saw Gilson, Inc. (HM-60) or_ NO BID 1008 % NO BID $ $ 35 1 }item 35 goes to ELE
1,571.66 2,487.95 $2,538.00 $1,797.50 $2,880.00
Large Forced Convected Oven Humboldt, Inc. (H-30360) $ 9 NO BID — 36 1 }item 36 goes to Humboldt
201.60 227.80 237.00 166.26 280.00 :
. s . $689.00 $1,107.00
Concrete Curing Tank with Circulator & Heater Gilson, Inc. (HM620 & HM 648) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 38 1 |item 38 goes to Humboldt
. LT $3,225.00 573.25 $2,850.00
Large Digital Scale Gilson, Inc. (AD-40KA) M NO BID NO BID _ $ 39 1 jitem 39 goes to VWR
. 1,029.83 $323.00 $354.88 $330.00
Small Digital Scale Gilson, Inc. (GP-306H) ® NO BID NO BID — 40 1 |item40 goes to Humboldt
. 3,434.27 ,388. 4,954.00 3,400.00 3,623.00
Large (Aggregate) Sieve Shaker ELE International (E180-0400/02) $ B0 NO BID $ 41 1 |item 4lgoes to ELE
AT TR 957.10 1,176.00 $696.00 $1,312.32 $1,277.00
Vacuum Pump 3100/02) NO BID ® ® 42 1 jlitems 41-46 go to Humboldt
. . $3,872.95 $2,600.00 $3,607.76 $2,922.00
Rapid Flash Point Tester www.gardco.com (RT-01) NO BID NO BID 43 1 Jitems 41-46 go to Humboldt
. 56.53 193.80 244.00 190.00 $658.05 $201.00
Marshall Water Baths ELE International (E145-6475/02) 4 $ $ 44 1 jlitems 41-46 go to Humboldt
. 5,166.30 6,578.00 ,854.00 4,013.00
Marshall Testing Machine Set ELE International (E15002/02) NO BID $ 8 o NO BID $ 45 1 Jitems 41-46 go to Humboldt
. 7,836.15 nb $5,510.00 $5,993.00
Los Angeles Abrasion Machine Set ELE International (E14216/02) NO BID s — NO BID 46 1 Jitems 41-46 go to Humboldt
e 988.00 817.00 6,647.00
Concrete Vibrator ELE International (E134-6430/02) NO BID B $ $ NO BID $ 47 1 |items 47-48 9o to ELE
Centrifuge Extractor Gilson, Inc. (HM-803) or NO BID $2,398.70 $2,887.00 $2,610.00 NO BID $3,754.40 48 1 |items 47-48 go to ELE
. . . $730.00 $959.80
Dispensing Hot Pot Gilson, Inc. (MS-64) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 49 1 |item 49 goes to Humboldt
. 598.40 740.00 565.00 $562.00
Air Entrainment Meter ELE International (E134-3265) NO BID NO BID 50 1 |jltem 50 goes to ELE
. 3,728.95 4,452.00 2,914.00 3,000.00
Ultrasonic Concrete Tester ELE International (E135-2310/09) NO BID » NO BID $ 51 1  Jitem 51 goes to Humboldt
. 3,558.95 $3,760.00 $4,140.00
Field CBR Set ELE International ( # 2400E) NO BID NO BID NO BID 52 1 ltiems 52-53 go {0 ELE
: 136.00 104.00 128.00
Slump Test Set ELE International (#3020E) NO BID #1028 $ $ NO BID $ 53 1 ltems 52-53 go to ELE
. 1,031.90 1,214.00 $828.00 $789.90
Unconfined Compression Accessory Set ELE International (#25-3998) NO BID ; ; — NO BID 54 1 |jltem 54 goes to Humboldt
Crime Lab
Description 'Vendor VWR ELE Internz&ional HartlLitimer Humboldt Fisher Pa_cific Quantit,
Digital Microscope Bodelin technology NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 55 1
Digital Microscope Bodelin technology NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 56 1
Ohaus Triple beam balance North Shore Care Supply $178.47 $119.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID 57 1




Farnswoth coler kit pipette.com NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 58
Pipette Controller pipette.com NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 59
Pipette Controller pipette.com NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 60
Pipette Controller pipette.com NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 61
Pipette Controller pipette.com NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 62
Centrifuge lab essentials NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 63
Freezer Fisher $772.18 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 64
water bath Fisher NO BID NO BID NO BID $3,276.97 NO BID 65
FT-IR Spectro Perkin-Elmer NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 66
Main lead Perkin-Elmer NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 67
10 cm Perkin-Elmer NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 68
kbr window Perkin-Elmer NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 69
press-n-;ock Perkin-Elmer NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 70
circular kbr Perkin Elmer NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 71
polarizer Perkin Elmer NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 72
lambda Perkin Elmer NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 73
Installation Perkin Elmer NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 74
cell Perkin Elmer NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 75
Is 55 Perkin Elmer NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 76
rectangular cell Perkin Elmer NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 77
lamda cell Perkin Elmer NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 78
lambda bio Perkin Elmer NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 79
gas chromatograph Perkin Elmer NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 80
preset regulator Perkin Elmer NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 81
Installation Perkin Elmer NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 82
detector make up Hoefer NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $269.60 NO BID 83
electrophoresis Hoefer NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 84
balnace analytical next day sciences $1,515.28 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 85
Munsell Soil color chart munsell store NO BID NO BID NO BID $102.74 NO BID 86
Multi-meter water YSI| NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 87
Flowmeter, mechanical www.instrumentsdirect.com NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 88
ROV multibeam sonar Blueview NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 89
ROV Navigation System Desert Star Systems NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 90
Omniprint 1000a Lighting Powder Company NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 91
Cyanowand Glue Fuming Kit Lighting Powder Company NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 92
Transits with tripods CST Berger Instruments NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 93




